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Abstract: 
Big Data is referred to, as the collection and quantities of huge information and 
data that are arranged in the most appropriate form and the best performance, 
which contributes to achieving the best benefit and saving time in the best 
manner. Furthermore, Big Data management overlaps with management 
sciences significantly, especially in the past few years, where big data 
management systems have contributed to the development of methodologies for 
general management, data management, and business management. In addition, 
since business management overlaps with all scientific, technical, and literary 
fields, and participates in the manufacture and development of many scientific 
methodologies and complex structures, the science of management needed to 
benefit from the great advances in big data management. Business 
administration is not portrayed as a separate concept. On the contrary, it 
overlaps with all concepts and structures, plays a major role in their 
development, and overlaps with their complex organizations, which contributes 
to their development. At the same time, big data plays a pivotal role today, as it 
is the methodology that can control a huge amount of data in a smooth, easy, 
and clear manner with very little or no errors.  This chapter explains extensively 
the link between business administration (with all its branches and divisions), 
with big data management, and provides a methodology for linking the two 
sciences, which contribute to providing developmental and future prospects that 
contribute to the development of business management with the highest possible 
benefit. 
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various benefits of managing big data and the various benefits that can be 
accessed can be noticed. 

Certainly, there are great horizons for improving and advancing humanity, 
and improving human understanding of each other. 

 
Recommendations 

 We recommend conducting new research and studies related to Big Data 
management and analysis 

 We recommend research related to real-time analysis of big data. 
 We recommend extensive studies regarding the useful applications of big 

data. 
 We recommend developing specialized systems for managing big data. 
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